
 

 

WHITE EAGLE MEDICINE WOMAN 

White Eagle Medicine Woman’s (Suraj Holzwarth) adventurous life began early, when at 
the age of 19 she moved to Alaska and became the youngest woman to climb Denali, 
North America's highest peak. With a deep love for the earth, she spent most of her early 
years in the wilds and guided wilderness expeditions throughout the world for over twenty 
years. In the late 90’s she received a vision in dreams with indigenous Grandmothers to 
create the world’s largest healing drum. Beginning in 2000 and taking over a year to 
construct, White Eagle and the multicultural Alaskan community built the seven-foot, 
crystal inlaid GrandMother Drum. In 2001, White Eagle and Grandmother Drum were 
launched on their first of many World Peace Tours inspiring unity, peace and “drumming 
up” awareness of earth sustainable projects with the theme “ The Heartbeat of One 
Family, One Earth.  
 
White Eagle is the founding director and Drum keeper of the GrandMother Drum 
International Peace Project and the 501c3 non-profit Whirling Rainbow Foundation. She is 
internationally known as a shamanic healer, seer, trance-medium, author, speaker, 
teacher, ceremonial and performance artist of Native American and European ancestry. 
She has traveled over a million miles touching a million people in 20 countries promoting 
unity, peace, tribal reconciliation, and earth sustainability. As a singer, chantress and world 
musician, White Eagle’s voice has a primal and mesmerizing quality, penetrating to the 
very heart and soul of our indigenous connection with each other and the earth. Her CDs 



include “Journey of the Heart”, “Songlines of the Soul”,  “Living Waters of Grace” and the 
newly released double CD, “Holy Ground”.  She is a master drum maker having made 
more than 5000 hand drums and 50 Community Mother Drums (3 feet crystal inlaid 
drums). 

White Eagle is also the director and co-producer of the documentary film “GrandMother 
Drum: Awakening the Global Heart”, selected as the Top 20 Spiritual Films at the Tel Aviv 
Spirit Film Festival in 2008. In 2010 and 2012, the “Traveling Song”, and “Birthing Chant” 
respectively won the “Alaska Song of the Year” in the World Music Category. She is the 
author of “The Magic Bundle” children’s book, and “Songs of A New Earth” songbook as 
well as the director of the Rainbow Fire Mystery School, operating month long shamanic 
schools in Alaska, Hawaii and Peru. Her extensive spiritual teachings are found in the 
“Language of One” and the “Heart of One” books and online courses. In 2013, White Eagle 
launched the Global Blue Flame Planetary Grid ceremony, activating and renewing the 
earth’s grid in a one day ceremony annually with 62 trained groups worldwide. 

Renamed by her tour staff, “Indiana Jane” for her utter perseverance to fund and travel the 
7ft thundering symbol of the heartbeat of love globally, White Eagle has certainly “traveled 
to the beat of a different drummer,” placing herself in the midst of countless social, racial 
tribal and political conflicts, environmental crisis’ and personal loss to sound the urgent call 
in awakening the heart of humanity. She has been honored to be initiated by many 
indigenous Elders and has been passed many of their ancient medicine bundles and 
global responsibilities. As a mother of two beautiful children and a total lover of humanity, 
White Eagle feels passionate that humanity can only move forward through positive 
prayerful activism focusing on the highest good of all and has often been referred to as the 
“Mother of the Rainbow Nation.” 

 

 
 


